
Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com>

Retaining wall between 11b Keble heights and 14 Trinity rise, College
Grove.
5 messages

Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com> 18 June 2015 at 13:39
To: ian@morisonlegal.com.au
Cc: Sharyl Marsh <Sharyl.Marsh@stjohnambulance.com.au>

Hi Ian

Regarding our pre-trail meeting today.
My email address is laughton.andrew@gmail.com

A brief summery of our meeting was that the Marshes were going to look into removing the overburden on
the original retaining wall in order to comply with building regulations.
The Marshes have been told that it would only cost between $5,000 and $10,000 to use a different
retaining wall construction method using big blocks rather than the reinforced concrete that the existing
building permit uses, with a potential saving of $10,000.
The Marshes agreed to get a firmer quote before a second pre-trail hearing on 30th July.

I agreed to ask for a more detailed quote from the people that supplied the $19,800 quote that I have been
given, to clarify the length of this new boundary retaining wall covered by the quote.

From Andrew Laughton, 11b Keble Heights, 0409 931 559

Ian Morison <ian@morisonlegal.com.au> 18 June 2015 at 15:10
To: Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com>

Thanks Andrew.

Regards

Ian Morison

Ian Morison

Barrister & Solicitor

Morison Legal

Email: ian@morisonlegal.com.au

Office 9792 4693 Mob 0418 916 709 Fax: 9791 7493

24 Arthur Street Bunbury
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PO Box 2666 Bunbury 6231

From: Andrew Laughton [mailto:laughton.andrew@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2015 1:40 PM
To: ian@morisonlegal.com.au
Cc: Sharyl Marsh
Subject: Retaining wall between 11b Keble heights and 14 Trinity rise, College
Grove.

[Quoted text hidden]

Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com> 18 June 2015 at 22:05
To: Ian Morison <ian@morisonlegal.com.au>, Sharyl Marsh <Sharyl.Marsh@stjohnambulance.com.au>

Hi People

Please be aware that is is costing me approx $500 per week in mortgage payments until I can sell my
house.
Selling my house with this outstanding issue is not going to be easy so I would like to clear this up as soon
as possible.

It would be good if you can keep me informed when and as you make any progress so that we can get as
much done as we can before the next pre-trail hearing.

Andrew.

[Quoted text hidden]

Sharyl Marsh <Sharyl.Marsh@stjohnambulance.com.au> 19 June 2015 at 07:54
To: Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com>

Morning Andrew

Please do not send emails to this address, this is my work email.

Regards

Sharyl
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Sharyl Marsh
Regional Administration Coordinator

St John Ambulance Western Australia Ltd.

South West Region,

270 Bussell Highway, Bunbury Western Australia 6230

Tel 08 93346725 | Mob 0447 120 780 | Fax 08 97913295

Sharyl.Marsh@stjohnambulance.com.au

Please click on our website for more information

www.stjohnambulancebunbury.com.au

From: Andrew Laughton [mailto:laughton.andrew@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2015 1:40 PM
To: ian@morisonlegal.com.au
Cc: Sharyl Marsh
Subject: Retaining wall between 11b Keble heights and 14 Trinity rise, College Grove.

Hi Ian

[Quoted text hidden]

Andrew Laughton <laughton.andrew@gmail.com> 19 June 2015 at 08:13
To: Ian Morison <ian@morisonlegal.com.au>

Hi Sharyl

What email address would you like me to use ?
This email address is the only one that I am aware of.

Andrew.

[Quoted text hidden]
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